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Editor's Note: The following is an Opinion Piece.
At the time of this writing, GAW Miners (GAM),
an American-based blockchain service provider
has suspended all services in the United States.
Previously, the company had announced that it
will shut down all servers that are in operation
within the United States. This comes after the
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U.S. Financial Crimes Enforcement Network
(FinCEN) issued an advisory in a letter which
indicated that it was monitoring Bitfinex, a

company connected to GAW Miners, concerning
its services and its affiliates. This creates a

dilemma for the customers of the GAW Miners-
Bitfinex platform. They have been urging the

GAW Miners, via Twitter, to make a strong
statement on what is actually happening. What
is going on? More importantly, what should they

do? Is there a final decision as to when the
service is going to stop operating? While there is
no specific mention of any company being shut
down, all of the information suggest that GAW
Miners is being shut down. This means that the

official Twitter account of the company is no
longer active. The page that had the information

related to the suspension of services is no
longer operational. Although it is, at this

moment, GAW Miners will not be delivering any
services. The website for GAW Miners does not

have any information indicating that the
services provided were to be suspended. There

was a simple message which stated that the
company was having a hard time. Not more
than an hour ago, the website for the GAW
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Miners has a message which says:
“Unfortunately, it has been brought to our

attention that we are no longer a legitimate
company in the United States. All services on
this site will be discontinued on Aug 10, 2019.
We apologize for this inconvenience and the

frustration this has caused you. We have taken
the proper steps to fix the problem. It is not a

problem with any individuals or our country. We
are sorry that this has occurred.” There is also a
link that takes to a page where customers can
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